
NIN Food Pantries Town/City Route Bus Route 6/10/2024

Iglesia Adventista Del Septimo Dia Jerusalen Lawrence 2

The 2 goes from Buckley to Main Street & School Street, 
Andover. Riders can request a stop at South Broadway & 
Massachusetts  28 and take a short walk to Iglesia Adventista 
del Septimo Dia Jerusalen.  

Iglesia Adventista Del Septimo Dia Jerusalen Lawrence 8

The 8 goes from Buckley to Woodridge Housing, North Andover. 
Riders can request a stop near Andover Street & Winthrop 
Street and walk about 0.3 miles to Iglesia Adventista Del 
Septimo Dia Jerusalen

Iglesia Adventista Del Septimo Dia Jerusalen Lawrence 7

The 7 goes from Buckley to Marriott Springhill Suites. Riders can 
request a stop near Shattuck Street & S Broadway, and walk 
about 0.3 miles to Iglesia Adventista Del Septimo Dia Jerusalen. 

First Church Congregational Methuen 10

The 10 goes from Buckley to Village Plaza- Dollar Tree. Riders 
can request a stop at Methuen Square and walk about 0.2 miles 
to First Church Congregational

First Church Congregational Methuen 6

The 6 goes from Buckley to Holy Family Hospital. Riders can 
request a stop at Lawrence Street & East Street and walk about 
0.5 miles to First Church Congregational

Neil Playstead Methuen 10

The 10  goes from Buckley to Village Plaza - Dollar Tree. Riders 
can request a stop at Massachusetts 28 & Messer Avenue and 
walk 0.4 miles to Neil Playstead

Neil Playstead Methuen 6

The 6 goes from Buckley to Holy Family Hospital. Riders can 
request a stop at Lawrence Street & East Street and take a short 
walk to Neil Playstead. 

Boys and Girls Club Lawrence 5

The 5 goes from Buckley to Branch Street- Dana Farber Cancer 
Institute. Riders can request a stop at Margin Street and walk 
0.2 miles to the Boys and Girls Club. 

Andover South Church Andover 2

The 2 goes from Buckley to Main Street & School Street, 
Andover. Riders can request a stop at 44 School Street and walk 
about 0.1 miles to South Church Andover  

Ministerio Apostolico Jesucristo es el Senor Lawrence 1
Riders can take the 1 to Jackson Street & Park Street and walk 
about 0.2 miles to Ministerio Apostolico. 

Diaper Pantry - 60 Island Street Lawrence 9

The 9 goes from Buckley to the North Andover Mall. Riders can 
request a stop near Union Street & Island Street and walk a 
short distance to the diaper pantry. 


